
People 
New Members Join 
Advisory Board 

Seven new members have joined 
AG AKD FOOD’S Editorial Advisory 
Board. They succeed the following 
members, whose terms have expired: 
Joseph W. Britton, C. H. Fisher, Lea 
S. Hitchner, K. D. Jacob, W. H. Mac- 
Intire, H. E. Robinson, and Charles 
P. Zorsch. The new members: 

George K. Davis is animal nutrition- 
ist at the Florida iigricultural Experi- - 

ment Station, and 
professor of nutri- 
tion at the Uni- 
versity of Florida. 
He has held both 
positions since 
1942, when he 
went to Floridd 
after five years at 
hiichigan State as 
assistant professor 

of chemistry. Before that he was an 
assistant in the Laboratory of Animal 
Nutrition at Coriiell, which awarded 
him a Ph.D. in animal nutrition with 
minors in pathology and physiology. 
His B.S. in agricultural and biological 
chemistry came from Penn State. Dr. 
Davis is perhaps best known for his 
work on the trace element nutrition of 
animals. His work with cobalt, 
copper, and molybdenum has changed 
the face of animal agriculture in the 
Southeast through correction of nutri- 
ent deficiencies and excesses, which 
previously curtai1,xl livestock produc- 
tion there. Dr. Davis is chairman of 
the Florida Section of the ACS. 

George C. Decker is entomologist 
and head of the section of economic 

entomology, Illi- 
nois Natural His- 
tory Survey and 
Illinois Agricul- 
tural Experiment 
Stdtion. He is 
also professor of 
entomology in the 
graduate college 
of the University 
of Illinois. Be- 

fore going to Illinois in 1944, Dr. 
Decker spent 18 years at Iowa Agri- 
cultural Experiment Station, in re- 
search. In 1938, he took a leave of 
absence to act as ,general supervisor of 
grasshopper control for USDA’s old 
Bureau of Entomology and Plant 
Quarantine. His graduate and under- 
graduate study wits performed at Iowa 
State College, although he is a native 
of Alichigan. In 1925-26, he served 

~ ~~ ~ ~~ 

as research entomologist with the 
Georgia Plant Board. 

William L. Hill has been a research 
chemist with the U. S. Department of 

Agriculture since 
1928. His special 
concern has been 
the chemistry of 
phosphates and 
its application to 
fertilizer manu- 
facture and use. 
This has included 
precise character- 
ization of chemi- 

cal and physical properties of ferti- 
lizer phosphates and their relationship 
to the performance of these com- 
pounds under different conditions of 
use. Hill was reared on a farm in 
Sniyth County, l’a. He received the 
B.S. from Milligan College. He  did 
graduate work at the University of 
Tennessee and the University of Vir- 
ginia, receiving the A I . S .  in chemistry 
from the latter. Hill taught science 
and mathematics in Tennessee high 
schools for two years, and served as 
instructor in chemistry and physics at 
his alma mater for three years before 
joining USDA. 

Louis Lykken is manager of the 
technical service department of 

the agricultural 
chemicals division 
of Shell Chemical 
C o r p .  Before  
t r a n s f e r r i n g  to  
Shell Chemical in 
1952, Dr. Lykken 
\vas with Shell 
D e v e  1 o p m e n t  
(from 1 9 3 8 ) ,  
where his work 

was concerned with the analysis 
of petroleum product.; and the de- 
velopment of analytical methods in 
various fields. Before his industrial 
positions, Dr. Lykken \vas a member 
of the faculty of Iowa State College, 
from which he received a P1i.D. in 
physical chemistry in 1933. Born in 
South Dakota, he earned his B.S. in 
chemical engineering from the South 
Dakota School of Mines and Tech- 
nology. He is a member of the execu- 
tive committee of the ACS Division of 
Agricultural and Food Chemistry, and 
chairman-elect of its Pesticides Sub- 
division. 

Harvey K .  Murer is director of re- 
search at General Foods’ new research 
center in Tarrytown, N. Y. He joined 
General Foods in 1941 as a research 

project l eade r ,  
and was promoted 
successively to 
l a b  d i r e c t o r  
(1945), staff tech- 
nologist (1948),  
and manager of 
the central labo- 
ratories (1950).  
His B.S. in chem- 
istrv was earned 

at Washington State College, and he 
has also studied at Harvard, North- 
western, and the University of Ten- 
nessee. His interests are in bio- 
chemistry, physiology, food process- 
ing, and research management. 

Joseph A. Noone has been technical 
adviser to the Sational Agricultural 

Chemicals Asso- 
ciation since 1949. 
A Philadelphian, 
Soone graduated 
from St. Joseph’s 
Co l l ege  t h e r e  
with a B.S. in 
c h e m i s t r y  i n  
1937. H e  joined 
Pennsalt in Phila- 
clelnhia immedi- 

ately after graduation, serving suc- 
cessively as chemist, chief chemist, 
and supervisor of the regulatory and 
consumer safety phases of marketing. 
H e  studied chemical engineering at 
Drexel Institute in Philadelphia and 
law at George Washington University 
in LVashington, D .  C. 

A. V. Slack is chief of the program 
develorment staff. division of chemi- 

cal development, 
Tennessee Valley 
Au thor i ty .  H e  
has been with 
TYA since 1941, 
the same year he 
ieceived an M.S. 
from the Univer- 
sity of Tennessee. 
At T\.,4, he has 
done control work 

in the ammonia plant, handled tech- 
nical liaison in patent matters, coordi- 
nated engineering for major plant proj- 
ects, and directed fertilizer research. 
He has published numerous papers in 
the field of fertilizer production tech- 
nology, including some on liquid and 
granulated fertilizers. 

IMC Changes 
George W. Moyers, a vice president 

of International Minerals since 1952, 
has been named head of the company’s 
new phosphate division, which was 
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formed by combining the old phos- 
phate chemicals and phosphate min- 
erals divisions. Heading the com- 
pany’s new staff division, which con- 
solidates research, engineering, and 
development, is I. Milton LeBaron, 
who was research vice president. 
Howard F. Roderick, who headed the 
phosphate chemicals division since its 
organization in 1953, has resigned to 
become vice president and director of 
hliles Laboratories, and president of its 
new chemical division. William Bel- 
lano, formerly in charge of IMC’s en- 
gineering division, was recently 
elected president of Gulf Sulphur 
Corp. 

Louis K. Eilers has been named 
president of Eastman Chemical Prod- 
ucts, Inc., and first vice president of 
Tennessee Eastman and Texas East- 
man. Dr. Eilers, who was vice presi- 
dent and assistant general manager of 
Eastman Kodak, succeeds William S.  
Vaughn, who has been elected vice 
president and general manager of 
Eastman Kodak. 

Louis H. Wilson, secretary and di- 
rector of information for the National 
Plant Food Institute, has received the 
meritorious service award from the 
National Association of Television and 
Radio Farm Directors. The award, 
the second to be presented in the or- 
ganization’s history, is the highest 
honor the organization confers. 

Victor M. Morgan has been named 
plant engineer of the Columbia, Tenn., 
plant of the phosphorus division of 
Hooker Chemical. Formerly an area 
engineer at Hooker’s Niagara Falls 
plant, he succeeds Theodore T. Gar- 
rett, who recently was promoted to 
works manager of the Columbia plant. 

Neal Van Kirk has left Darling & 
Co. to become general traffic manager 
for Commercial Solvents Corp. 

Morse G. Dial has been named 
chairman of the board and chief ex- 
ecutive officer of Union Carbide, 
Succeeding him as president is How- 
ard S. Bunn, former executive vice 
president. Kenneth H. Hannan con- 
tinues as executive vice president, and 
Birney Mason, Jr., vice president, be- 
comes executive vice president. 
Mason and Kenneth Rush, vice presi- 
dent, have been added to the board. 

R. M. Richey has been named gen- 
eral superintendent of fertilizer pro- 
duction for American Agricultural 
Chemical. Succeeding him as west- 
ern division superintendent is R. E. 
Lehmkuhl, former production manager 
for the plants at Danville, Ill., and 
Seymour, Ind. 

Robert P. Malcolmnson has joined 
Stauffer as technical sales representa- 

tive for the agricultural chemicals 
division, with headquarters at Holton, 
hlich. He has been associated with 
the Soil Conservation Service and has 
taught vocational agriculture. 

Carroll A. Clark has been elected 
president of McLaughlin Gormley 
King. George A. McLaughlin, former 
president, remains as chairman of the 
board and chief executive officer. 
Clark has been vice president and 
general manager of the parent com- 
pany since 1947 and president of Mc- 
Laughlin Farm Chemicals, Inc., since 
1953. He  will continue to hold the 
latter position. 

A. H. Robertson, New York State 
Department of Agriculture and Mar- 
kets, was recently elected president of 
the Association of Official Agricultural 
Chemists. 

William J. Crist has been ap- 
pointed manager of Canadian sales for 
Panogen Co. of Canada, Ltd., a newly 
formed subsidiary of Slorton Salt Co. 
He will be assisted by two field repre- 
sentatives, Lionel Hart and James 
Taylor. Headquarters will be in 
Winnipeg. 

Proctor W. Gull has been trans- 
ferred from his post as manager of 
Spencer’s agricultural market develop- 
ment to the post of manager of new 
agricultural product development in 
the research and development division, 
James Z. Hoffman, who has returned 
to Spencer after a year’s leave of ab- 
sence, has been named senior market 
analyst in agricultural market research. 
In other personnel changes at Spencer, 
Paul L. Weller, who was eastern repre- 
sentative for the research and develop- 
ment division, has transferred to the 
industrial chemicals division. Duncan 
Kincheloe, Illinois sales representa- 
tive, has been assigned to North 
Carolina, succeeding Tom L. Camp- 
bell, who recently became southeast- 
ern sales manager. F. A. McGuire, 
superintendent of the ammonia sec- 
tion of the Jayhawk Works, has been 
transferred to Illinois to take over the 
area formerly served by Kincheloe. 

Dorvan C. Rolston has joined 
Slississippi River Chemical Co. as a 
sales representative in El Paso, Ill. 

John H. Guill, Jr., has been named 
chief of the Chicago district of the 
Food and Drug Administration, suc- 
ceeding George T. Daughters, who has 
become chief of the Detroit district. 
Guill was chief inspector in the St. 
Louis district. 

Frank M. Strong, professor of bio- 
chemistry at the University of Wis- 
consin, takes over as 1959 chairman of 

the Division of Agricultural and Food 
Chemistry of the ACS, succeeding H. 
L. Haller of USDA. Chairman-elect 
of the division is Lloyd W. Hazleton, 
Hazleton Laboratories. 

William C. McConnell has left 
Woolfolk Chemical Works, which he 
served as plant manager, to join the 
agricultural chemical sales department 
of Columbia-Southern Chemical Corp. 
in Pittsburgh, Pa. 

Thomas B. Potter has been named 
administrative assistant to W. Ward 
Jackson, vice president-sales, Com- 
mercial Solvents. Potter returns to 
CSC after a two-year stint as secretary 
and assistant treasurer of Northwest 
Sitro-Chemicals, Ltd., a CSC affiliate 
in Canada. 

Arnold Bullis has been appointed 
laboratory supervisor a t  the fertilizer 
plant of William Stone Co., Ingersoll, 
Ont. He was formerly with Canadian 
Industries, Ltd. 

Jack C. Bauernfeind has been ap- 
pointed director of food and agricul- 
tural products development for Hoff- 
mann-La Roche, Inc. He was director 
of applied nutrition. 

John B. Clopton, Albert E. New, 
and W. Mayo Smith have been named 
vice presidents of Escambia Chemical. 
Clopton is to be director of sales; New, 
director of production; and Smith, di- 
rector of research. 

Fritz Anspach has been named man- 
ager of technical sales and service for 
the I. P. Thomas Division of Dixon 
Chemical Industries, Inc. He is to 
head up a new service organization to 
provide Xliddle Atlantic states farm- 
ers with more field and laboratory 
assistance in fertilizer selection. He 
has been engaged in farm advisory 
work for the past 19 years. 

Kenneth E. Cooley has left Chem- 
agro to join the technical services de- 
partment of hlonsanto’s organic chemi- 
cals division at St. Louis. 

Paul M. Ruedrich has left Griffen 
Chemical Co., where he was technical 
director, to become research director 
for Colloidal Products Corp. He will 
work with C. E. Miller, technical vice 
president, in the development and 
manufacture of adjuvants for agricul- 
tural chemicals. 

Claude T. Davis has been ap- 
pointed by Calspray as assistant to 
E. L. Stripling, regional manager- 
southern. He was formerly assistant 
to the district manager in the Missis- 
sippi Delta area. Frank B. Walker 
has been named sales development 
manager in Latin America. 
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